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I began writing this book approximately a month after I was accepted to dental school. I understood how
fortunate I was to be allowed to step foot in that building every day, and I will never take that privilege for
granted. When the thought about applying to dental school first entered my mind, I soon realized that there
were literally no books available providing anecdotal experiences of the process I was about to embark on.
So, I decided to write this book. Whenever I had spare time from class, lab or clinic, I found myself writing.
If you are reading this book, I am sure you are in the same position that I was in a few short years ago, or you
may be interested in how the whole process works. In any event, I am happy you are here. Gaining
admissions to dental school is a highly stressful and may consume your every thought. The anxiety of not
knowing where you stand in the eyes of the admissions committee will surely wear you down emotionally
and physically. How do I know this, because I had it happen to me…twice. In this book, I outline my leading
up to my decision to apply to dental school. Then, my focus changes to explain the mistakes I made during
my first application cycle and the remarkable change inside me that motivated me to enhance every aspect of
my application. Use this book to motivate you, and use it to get into dental school. Your experiences are
unique, and you may be in a worse situation now then I was then. I currently am a dentist, and I work for my
mentor. I intend to buy his practice in the year to follow. IF I CAN DO IT, SO CAN YOU!
***As a bonus, at the very end of the book, I provided 7 interview secrets that I had learned from serving on
an admissions committee for 2 years.
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From reader reviews:

Carl Guerra:

You could spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This The Dental School Admissions Guide I
Wish I Had: How I did it with a low gpa is simple to create you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and
also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-
book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. So there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Violet Iverson:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. This particular The Dental School Admissions Guide I Wish I Had:
How I did it with a low gpa can give you a lot of friends because by you checking out this one book you
have issue that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This specific book can be
one of a step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't
learn, by knowing more than additional make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let's have
The Dental School Admissions Guide I Wish I Had: How I did it with a low gpa.

Mario Curtin:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This particular book The Dental School Admissions Guide I
Wish I Had: How I did it with a low gpa was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we
know that book The Dental School Admissions Guide I Wish I Had: How I did it with a low gpa has many
kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think
you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it makes you feel
happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that will.

Tammy Carver:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news. Within this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
in search of the The Dental School Admissions Guide I Wish I Had: How I did it with a low gpa when you
required it?
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