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Michelle Maxwell has just blown her future with the Secret Service. Against her instincts, she let a
presidential candidate out of her sight to comfort a grieving widow. Then, behind closed doors, the politician
whose safety was her responsibility vanished into thin air.

Living a new life on a quiet lake in central Virginia, Sean King knows how the younger agent feels. He's
been there before. In an out-of-the-way hotel eight years earlier, the hard-charging Secret Service man
allowed his attention to be diverted for a split second. And the presidential candidate Sean was protecting
was gunned down before his eyes.

Now Michelle and Sean are about to see their destinies converge. She has become obsessed with Sean's case.
And he needs a friend-especially since a series of macabre killings has brought him under suspicion and
prompted the reappearance of a seductive woman he's tried hard to forget.

As the two discredited agents enter a maze of lies, secrets, and deadly coincidences, they uncover a shocking
truth: that the separate acts of violence that shattered their lives were really a long time in the making-and are
a long way from over...
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From reader reviews:

Bert Gomes:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
even playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read any book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you
can spent the entire day to reading a e-book. The book Split Second it doesn't matter what good to read.
There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. When
you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore simply
to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book features high quality.

Travis Wysocki:

This Split Second is great publication for you because the content which is full of information for you who
have always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it data
accurately using great manage word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the
idea hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward
sentences but challenging core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Split Second in
your hand like keeping the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no
publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen small right but this book already do that. So , this really
is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt which?

Wendy Clark:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you
study a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your examine, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The Split
Second offer you a new experience in looking at a book.

Orville Hightower:

A lot of guide has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
identified as of book Split Second. You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed
book, it may add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware
about reserve. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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